Oakland County Purchasing Division

Contract Name: Institutional Supplies - PCARD-COOP-B

QOAKLAND: @

Supplier Contract

Supplier:

0000000966
Bob Barker Co Inc
PO Box 429

+1 (800) 3349880

COUN L NLEHLO AR Contract Number CON00009870
PURCHASING
Contract Reference 4030101/1060501
Contract Start Date 09/01/2022
Contract End Date 08/31/2023
Payment Type Check
Buyer Joseph Dahl
Phone Number 248-858-0511
Email dahlj@oakgov.com
Page 1 of 1
Currency Total Line Amount Original Total Contract Total Contract Amount
Amount
UsD 125,000.00 125,000.00
Summary:

Fuquay Varina, NC 27526
United States of America

Institutional Supplies - Ordered on an "As Needed" basis.

Messages

Contract number must appear on all contract-related correspondence.

K. Ntcole Myntt

K. Nicole Myatt (Aug 26,‘5022 12:02 EDT)

Seott N Guzzy

Scott N. Guzzy (Aug 25, 202215:26 EDT)



Bob Barker

Institutional Supplies - Price List
Effective 09/01/2022

Oakland County Sheriff's Office

1201 N. Telegraph Rd. Building 10 East, Pontiac, Ml 48341

CATEGORY: LINENS

EAST ANNEX

BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER

ITEM DESCRIPTION

NOTES and Exceptions regarding

Price Each Items Bid
WC1212 Washcloth, White, 12x12, .75lb $2.16 per Dozen el ity by e By
Wwc12128V Washcloth, Navy 12x12 $3.48 per Dozen Sold only by the Dozen
WBC1518 Towel, Bar Cloth, All Purpose Terry Cloth $3.48 per Dozen el ity by e By
41400 Towel, White, Super, 20x40, 5.5|b $17.16 per Dozen el iy by e By
BT20408R Towel, Brown, 20x40, Slbs. $16.08 per Dozen Sold only by the Dozen
VSB6690WH Blanket, Thermal, White, Snagless, 66x90 $162.00 per Case of 24 Sold only in a Case of 24
VSB6690RB Blanket, Thermal, Royal Blue, Snagless, 66x90 $91.92 per Dozen el ity by e By
SH5490N Sheet, Flat, 130 Thread Count, White, 54x90 $26.88 per Dozen el ity by e By
MAIN JAIL
41400 Towel, White, Super, 20x40, 5.5|b $17.16 per Dozen el ity by e By
SH5490N Sheet, Flat, 130 Thread Count, White, 54x90 $26.88 per Dozen el ity by e By
SH54900RN Sheet, Flat, 130 Thread Count, Orange, 54x90 $33.12 per Dozen el ity by e By
WC1212 Washcloth, White, 12x12, .75lb $2.16 per Dozen el ity by e By
VSB6690RB Blanket, Thermal, Royal Blue, Snagless, 66x90 $91.92 per Dozen el iy by e By
HDT-1426 Dish Towel, Herringbone

$4.92 per Dozen

Sold only by the Dozen

CATEGORY: UNIFORMS/CLOTHING

EAST ANNEX (uniforms in multiple colors/sizes)

BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Price Each
Attachment Vinyl Wristbands - Red $115.00 per Case of 500 ]
Attachment Vinyl Wristbands - Navy $115.00 per Case of 500 ]
Attachment Vinyl Wristbands - Silver $115.00 per Case of 500 ]
Attachment Vinyl Wristbands - Gold $115.00 per Case of 500 ]
ZSSGYH-2XL Sweatshirt, Hooded (no string), Gray, 2XL Sold only by the Dozen; Non-Stock
$118.44 per Dozen item; Lead-time of 12 weeks
ZSSGYH-4XL Sweatshirt, Hooded (no string), Gray, 4XL Sold only by the Dozen; Non-Stock
$118.44 per Dozen item; Lead-time of 12 weeks
ZSSGYH-L Sweatshirt, Hooded (no string), Gray, L Sold only by the Dozen; Non-Stock
$118.44 per Dozen item; Lead-time of 12 weeks
ZSSGYH-XL Sweatshirt, Hooded (no string), Gray, XL Sold only by the Dozen; Non-Stock
$118.44 per Dozen item; Lead-time of 12 weeks
UWS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, XL $6.36
UWS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 2XL $6.36
TWS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 3XL $6.42
TWS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 4XL $6.42
UWT-XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, XL $7.35
UWT-2XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, 2XL $7.35
TWT-3XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, 3XL $7.35
UWT-4XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, 4XL $8.09
1025K-OR Beanie Hat, Orange, OSFA $13.47 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
24212-2XL Jumpsuit, Navy Gripper, 2XL $14.63
24212-L Jumpsuit, Navy Gripper, L $14.63
24212-XL Jumpsuit, Navy Gripper, XL $14.63
24220-2XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 2XL $14.63
24220-3XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 3XL $14.63
24220-4XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 4XL $14.63
24220-XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, XL $14.63
24220-5XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 5XL

$14.63




24220-6XL

Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 6XL

$14.63
24220-7XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 7XL Non-Stock size - Size 7XL is only sold in a case of
$90.00 PER CASEOF 6 |6
24220-8XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 8XL $15.00
24220-9XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 9XL 690.00 PER CASE OF 6 gon-Stock size - Size 9XL is only sold in a case of
24220-10XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 10XL $15.00
112-2XL Drawers, Unisex Thermal Wear, 2XL $32.66 Sold by the Dozen
112-3XL Drawers, Unisex Thermal Wear, 3XL $32.66 Sold by the Dozen
112-4XL Drawers, Unisex Thermal Wear, 4XL $32.66 Sold by the Dozen
63-2XL Top, Unisex Thermal Wear, 2XL $32.66 Sold by the Dozen
63-3XL Top, Unisex Thermal Wear, 3XL $32.66 Sold by the Dozen
63-4XL Top, Unisex Thermal Wear, 4XL $32.66 Sold by the Dozen
WCS16 Sock, Crew, White, Size 13-16 $5.26 Sold by the Dozen
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 9 $49.92 per Case of 48 ?_:I:] :zlziin glcaelois
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 10 Sold only in a case of 48.
$49.92 per Case of 48  [Trim to Fit
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 11 $49.92 per Case of 48 ?_:I:] :zlziin glcaelois
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 12 $49.92 per Case of 48 ?_:I:] :zlziin glcaelbis
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 13 $49.92 per Case of 48 ?_:I:] :zlziin glcaelbis
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 14 No Bid
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 15 No Bid
82221EE-10 Boot, Steel Toe, Black, 10EE $26.50
82221EE-11 Boot, Steel Toe, Black, 11EE $26.50
82221EE-12 Boot, Steel Toe, Black, 12EE $26.50
82221EE-13 Boot, Steel Toe, Black, 13EE $26.50
MAIN JAIL (uniforms in multiple colors/sizes)
Uws-m Shirt, TriStitch, White, MD $6.23
UWS-L Shirt, TriStitch, White, LG $6.23
UWS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, XL $6.36
UWS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 2XL $6.36
TWS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 3XL $6.42
TWS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 4XL $6.42
TWS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 6XL $6.42
TWS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 8XL $6.42
TWS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, White, 10XL $6.42
UWT-M Trousers, TriStitch, White, M $7.35
UWT-L Trousers, TriStitch, White, L $7.35
UWT-XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, XL $7.35
UWT-2XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, 2XL $7.35
TWT-3XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, 3XL $7.35
UWT-4XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, 4XL $8.09
TWT-6XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, 6XL $8.09
TWT-8XL Trouser, TriStitch, White, 8XL $8.09
TWT-10XL Trousers, TriStitch, White, 10XL $8.09
TGS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Green, L $5.40
TGS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Green, XL $5.46
TGS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Green, 2XL $5.63
TGS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Green, 3XL $5.87
TGS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Green, 4XL $6.79
TGS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, Green, 6XL

$6.79




TGS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, Green, 8XL $6.79
TGS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, Green, 10XL $6.79
TGT-L Trouser, TriStitch, Green, L $7.35
TGT-XL Trouser, TriStitch, Green, XL $7.35
TGT-2XL Trouser, TriStitch, Green, 2XL $7.35
TGT-3XL Trouser, TriStitch, Green, 3XL $7.35
TGT-4XL Trouser, TriStitch, Green, 4XL $7.90
TGT-6XL Trouser, TriStitch, Green, 6XL $7.90
TGT-8XL Trouser, TriStitch, Green, 8XL $7.90
TGT-10XL Trouser, TriStitch, Green, 10XL $7.90
UNS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Navy, L $6.52
UNS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Navy, XL $6.77
TNS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Navy, 2XL $6.77
TNS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Navy, 3XL $7.16
UNS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Navy, 4XL $7.44
TNS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, Navy, 6XL $7.44
TNS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, Navy, 8XL $7.44
TNS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, Navy, 10XL $7.44
UNT-L Trouser, TriStitch, Navy, L $7.35
UNT-XL Trouser, TriStitch, Navy, XL $7.35
TNT-2XL Trouser, TriStitch, Navy, 2XL $7.35
TNT-3XL Trouser, TriStitch, Navy, 3XL $7.35
TNT-4XL Trouser, TriStitch, Navy, 4XL $8.78
TNT-6XL Trouser, TriStitch, Navy, 6XL $8.76
TNT-8XL Trouser, TriStitch, Navy, 8XL $8.76
TNT-10XL Trouser, TriStitch, Navy, 10XL $8.76
TGYS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Gray, L $5.87
TGYS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Gray, XL $6.16
TGYS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Gray, 2XL $6.16
TGYS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Gray, 3XL $6.16
TGYS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Gray, 4XL $6.16
TGYS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, Gray, 6XL $42.00 Per Case of 6 N°n'sit:2ké:; 'D(;’:S'y selé
TGYS-8XL shirt, TriStitch, Gray, 8XL $42.00 Per Case of 6 N°n'sit:2ké:; 'D(;’:S'y selé
TGYS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, Gray, 10XL $42.00 Per Case of 6 N°n'sit:2ké:; 'D(;’:S'y selé
TGYT-L Trouser, TriStitch, Gray, L $7.35
TGYT-XL Trouser, TriStitch, Gray, XL $7.35
TGYT-2XL Trouser, TriStitch, Gray, 2XL $7.35
TGYT-3XL Trouser, TriStitch, Gray, 3XL $7.35
TGYT-4XL Trouser, TriStitch, Gray, 4XL $7.52
TGYT-6XL Trouser, TriStitch, Gray, 6XL $7.52
TGYT-8XL Trouser, TriStitch, Gray, 8XL $49.98 Per Case of 6 N°n'sit:2ké:; 'D(;’:S'y selé
TGYT-10XL Trouser, Tristitch, Gray, 10XL $49.98 Per Case of 6 N°n'sit:2ké:; 'D(;’:S'y selé
UOoS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Orange, L $6.55
UOS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange, XL $6.55
UOS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange, 2XL $6.92
TOS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange, 3XL $6.92
UOS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange, 4XL $7.30
TOS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange, 6XL $7.30
UOS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange, 8XL $7.30
UOS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange, 10XL $7.30
UOT-L Trouser, TriStitch, Orange, L $7.35
UOT-XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange, XL $7.35
UOT-2XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange, 2XL

$7.35




TOT-3XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange, 3XL $7.35
UOT-4XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange, 4XL $8.37
TOT-6XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange, 6XL $8.37
TOT-8XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange, 8XL $8.37
TOT-10XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange, 10XL $8.37
TOWS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, L $5.00
TOWS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, XL $5.26
TOWS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 2XL $5.26
TOWS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 3XL $5.26
TOWS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 4XL $5.79
TOWS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 6XL $40.20 per Case of 6 N°n'sit:2ké:; 'D(;’;'y selé
TOWS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 8XL $40.20 per Case of 6 N°n'sit:2ké:; 'D(;’;'y selé
TOWS-10XL shirt, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 10XL WariSfietlx e <Qlitly sl
$40.20 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TOWT-L Trouser, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, L $6.60
TOWT-XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, XL $6.79
TOWT-2XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 2XL $6.79
TOWT-3XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 3XL $6.79
TOWT-4XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 4XL $7.00
TOWT-6XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 6XL $48.00 per Case of 6 Non-Sit:cakcs;st -D(;r:y selé
TOWT-8XL Trouser, TriStitch, Orange/White Stripe, 8XL $52.02 per Case of 6 Non-Sit:cakcs;st -D(;r:y selé
TOWT-10XL Trouser, Tristitch, Orange/White Stripe, 10XL WarmSfiotx crie <Qlitly sl
$52.02 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
24220-M Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, M $14.63
24220-L Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, L $14.63
24220-XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, XL $14.63
24220-2XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 2XL $14.63
24220-3XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 3XL $14.63
24220-4XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 4XL $14.63
24220-5XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 5XL $14.63
24220-6XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 6XL $14.63
24220-7XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 7XL $90.00 per Case of 6 Non-Sit:cakcs;st -D(;r:y it
24220-8XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 8XL $15.00
24220-9XL Jumpsuit, Green Gripper, 9XL $90.00 per Case of 6 Non-Sit:cakcs;st -D(;r:y it
24220-10XL Jumpsuit, Green Grippper, 10XL $15.00
NJN-M Jumpsuit, Blue Grippper, M Postman Blue color is a non-stock color and is
$90.00 per Case of 6 only sold in a case of 6 per size
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TLGS-S Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, S $4.90
TLGS-M Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, M $4.90
TLGS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, L $5.38
TLGS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, XL $5.70
TLGS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, 2XL $5.70
TLGS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, 3XL $6.04
TLGS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, 4XL $6.04
TLGS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, 6XL $6.04
TLGS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, 8XL $6.04
TLGS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, Lime Green, 10XL $6.04
TLGT-S Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, S

$7.35




TLGT-M Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, M $7.35
TLGT-L Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, L $7.35
TLGT-XL Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, XL $7.35
TLGT-2XL Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, 2XL $7.35
TLGT-3XL Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, 3XL $7.35
TLGT-4XL Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, 4XL $7.58
TLGT-6XL Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, 6XL $7.58
TLGT-8XL Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, 8XL $7.58
TLGT-10XL Trouser, TriStitch, Lime Green, 10XL $7.58
TWNS-S Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, S $4.90
TWNS-M Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, M $5.28
TWNS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, L $5.28
TWNS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, XL $5.39
TWNS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, 2XL ¢5.53
TWNS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, 3XL $5.67
TWNS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, 4XL ¢5.87
TWNS-6XL Shirt, Tristitch, Wine, 6XL Non-Stock size -Only sold
$45.00 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TWNS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, 8XL Non-Stock size -Only sold
$45.00 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TWNS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, Wine, 10XL Non-Stock size -Only sold
$45.00 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TWNT-S Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, S $7.35
TWNT-M Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, M $7.35
TWNT-L Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, L $7.35
TWNT-XL Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, XL $7.35
TWNT-2XL Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, 2XL $7.35
TWNT-4XL Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, 4XL $7.77
TWNT-6XL Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, 6XL Non-Stock size -Only sold
$46.62 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TWNT-8XL Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, 8XL Non-Stock size -Only sold
$51.96 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TWNT-10XL Trouser, TriStitch, Wine, 10XL Non-Stock size -Only sold
$51.96 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TYS-S Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, S $5.12
TYS-M Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, M $5.79
TYS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, L $5.97
TYS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, XL $6.36
TYS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, 2XL $6.77
TYS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, 3XL $6.77
TYS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, 4XL $6.77
TYS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, 6XL $7.50
TYS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, 8XL $7.50
TYS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, Yellow, 10XL $7.50
TYT-S Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, S $7.35
TYT-M Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, M $7.35
TYT-L Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, L $7.35
TYT-XL Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, XL $7.35
TYT-2XL Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, 2XL $7.35
TYT-3XL Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, 3XL $7.35
TYT-4XL Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, 4XL $7.88
TYT-6XL Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, 6XL $8.44
TYT-8XL Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, 8XL $8.44
TYT-10XL Trousers, TriStitch, Yellow, 10XL $8.44
TBWS-S Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, S Non-Stock size -Only sold

$31.50 per Case of 6

in a Case of 6




TBWS-M Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, M $5.44
TBWS-L Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, L $5.44
TBWS-XL Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, XL $5.62
TBWS-2XL Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 2XL $5.70
TBWS-3XL Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 3XL $6.08
TBWS-4XL Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 4XL $6.08
TBWS-6XL Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 6XL $6.08
TBWS-8XL Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 8XL $7.30
TBWS-10XL Shirt, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 10XL Non-Stock size -Only sold
$43.80 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TBWT-S Trouser, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, S Non-Stock size -Only sold
$37.20 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
TBWT-M Trousers, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, M $6.42
TBWT-L Trouser, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, L $6.42
TBWT-XL Trousers, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, XL $6.73
TBWT-2XL Trouser, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 2XL $6.83
TBWT-3XL Trousers, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 3XL $6.97
TBWT-4XL Trousers, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 4XL $6.97
TBWT-6XL Trousers, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 6XL $7.53
TBWT-8XL Trousers, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 8XL $7.53
TBWT-10XL Trousers, TriStitch, Black/White Stripe, 10XL Non-Stock size -Only sold
$46.92 per Case of 6 in a Case of 6
SEVA-OR-S Sandal, SEVA Orange, S $3.58
SEVA-OR-M Sandal, SEVA Orange, M $3.58
SEVA-OR-L Sandal, SEVA Orange, L $3.58
SEVA-OR-XL Sandal, SEVA Orange, XL $3.58
SEVA-OR-2XL Sandal, SEVA Orange, 2XL $3.58
Work Coat, Blue, 100% Cotton, Blanket Lined,
652-BL-4648
46/48 Chest $19.52
Work Coat, Blue, 100% Cotton, Blanket Lined,
652-BL-5052
50/52Chest $19.52
Work Coat, Blue, 100% Cotton, Blanket Lined,
652-BL-5456
54/56 Chest $19.52
SKTW22 Sock, White Tube, Over The Calf
$6.78 Sold by the Dozen
Attachment Womens Insertable Insoles - Size 4 .
No Bid
Attachment Womens Insertable Insoles - Size 5 .
No Bid
Attachment Womens Insertable Insoles - Size 6 .
No Bid
Attachment Womens Insertable Insoles - Size 7 .
No Bid
Attachment Womens Insertable Insoles - Size 8 .
No Bid
Attach t M I table Insoles - Size 6
achmen ens Insertable Insoles - Size No Bid
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 7 Sold only in a case of 48.
$49.92 per Case of 48  [Trim to Fit
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 8 SelklentyhacEeeias
$49.92 per Case of 48  [Trim to Fit
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 9 SelklentyhacEeeias
$49.92 per Case of 48  [Trim to Fit
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 10 SelklentyhacEeeias
$49.92 per Case of 48  [Trim to Fit
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 11 SelklentyhacEeeias
$49.92 per Case of 48  [Trim to Fit
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 12 SelklentyhacEeeias
$49.92 per Case of 48  [Trim to Fit
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 13 SelklentyhacEeeias
$49.92 per Case of 48  [Trim to Fit
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 14 .
No Bid
Attachment Mens Insertable Insoles - Size 15 .
No Bid
B415E-4 Boot, Black E ic, 4E
oot, Black Economic, $13.20
B415E-5 Boot, Black E ic, 5E
oot, Black Economic, $13.20
B415E-6 Boot, Black E ic, 6E
oot, Black Economic, $13.20
B415E-7 Boot, Black Economic, 7E

$13.20




CATEGORY: PERSONAL CARE/HYGEINE

EAST ANNEX
BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION .
Price Each
HC1094-1 Remington Hair Cut Kit - 14-Piece Set s15.22 Rem'”gg?" X ':,:ce (T
. ipper Ki
22725 Model #BTF, Andis, Versatrim Cord/Cordless
Beard & MustacheTrimmer No Bid
ASCRB500 o] Anti-Shank Colored R Blad
range Anti-shank Colored Razor Blace $90.00 per Case of 500 Sold in a case of 500
TC12 Toenail Clippers, Metal, No File $6.72 e 6
. ase 0
PT1 Clipper, Fingernail, No File $7.68 e 24
. ase 0
MAIN JAIL $
BBST25 Toothbrush, Short Handle, 25 Tuft $6.93 @ Gam
. ase 0
MSTP Toothpaste, Max Security, .15 oz Clear Single
Use Packet $58.00 Case of 1000
ASCRB500 o] Anti-Shank Colored R Blad
range Anti-shank Colored Razor Blace $90.00 per Case of 500 Sold in a case of 500
102012 Shoe Polish, Black Paste, 3 oz. No Bid
HC1094-1 Remington Hair Cut Kit, 14-Piece Set s15.22 Rem'”gg?" w ':,:ce IRE?
. ipper Ki
22725 Model #BTF, Andis, Versatrim Cord/Cordless
Beard & MustacheTrimmer No Bid
B2430 Laundry Bag, 24x30 Sliplock, Blue $36.72 sold onlv by the D
. old only by the Dozen
W2430 Laundry Bag, 24x30 Sliplock, White $36.72 sold onlv by the D
. old only by the Dozen
TC12 Toenail Clippers, Metal, No File $6.72 sold onlv by the D
. old only by the Dozen
Attachment Womens Custom Shower Curtain $13.09 1k G(;een, SZtXW 09
. rommets
Attachment Mens Custom Shower Curtain $13.09 Lets G(;een, SZtXW 09
. rommets
#4 Naturelle Maxi Pads, Individually Boxed
Sanitary Napkins $38.89 Case of 250
TAM500 Tampon, Vended Style - Individually Wrapped
$72.74 Case of 500
CATEGORY: RECREATION
EAST ANNEX
BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION .
Price Each
P00009 Monopoly Game $22.43
P00390 Sorry Game $13.91
PH10 Phase 10 Card Game $6.28
SKIP Skip-bo Card Game $8.30
UNO2 Uno Card Game - Deck $6.48
NE950 Yahtzee Game $10.03
1703 Four(4) In A Row Game $9.90
MAIN JAIL
500LCD Camtainer Insulated B S , 5 gall
amtainer Insulated Beverage Server, 5 gallon $169.13
8224 Dictionary, Scrabble $5.91
4708 Checker Game $4.89
4833 Chess Set $5.33
4832 Backgammon Game $5.60
P0009 Monopoly Game $22.43
P0044 Risk G
isk Game $32.88
4024 Scrabble G
crabble Game $22.35
CATEGORY: SECURITY/PREVENTION
MAIN JAIL
ESU25 P; Utensil, EcoSecurit:
aper Utensll, tcosecurity $170.00 per case of 2500 Sold in a case of 2500
Isolation/Suicide Cell Blanket, Sherwood Green,
$B5480 80x54 $72.49
505 Isolation/Suicide Cell Smock, Sherwood Green,
34-52 and/or 44-56 $76.24




Children's Village

County Service Center Building J-63 West, Waterford MI 48328

CATEGORY: LINENS / BEDDING

BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Price Each

Flat Sheet, T - 130, 55% cotton/45% poly blend

SH6104L 3/8" double turned hems, clean finish. 16Ib per
dozen, 66" X 104", White $42.12 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
HT1525 Hand Towel, 100% Cotton Terry Cloth 15"x25"
White $6.84 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
o [ e e
3 3 ,
$57.32
COT30754 Mattress 30"X75"X4" Flame Resistant, Cotton
Core", FlameChek Ultra, 30"x75"x4", Blue Cover $64.47
Mattress 36"x80"x6" Innerspring, Flame
€63680 Retardant, Antimicrobial, Waterproof,
36"x80"x6", Blue Cover No Bid
2026 Pillow Poly, Vented, White, Polyester Core,
20"x26", White $6.56

ZRCBN-RB, ZRCBN-RS

Bedspread, 100% Polyester, Flame Retardant
Color: Royal Blue, Rose - Priced by: CA/12

$198.84 per Dozen

Sold by the Dozen per
color

Blanket, 100% cotton, Snag-free, 2.5 lbs. 66x90

BLSFG Color: Gray - Price Ea. $9.08
2127 Blanket, 100% cotton, Thermal , 2.4 Ibs. Color
White 66x90 - Price Ea $6.94
W2430 Laundry Bag, 100% polyester mesh, slip lock
24X30 COLOR: White - Price per DZ $36.72 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
Wz1824 Laundry Bag, 100% Polyester Mesh, Zippered
18x24 Color: White - Price per DZ $25.20 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
Laundry Storage Bag, Hvy Wt. w/Drawstring
SLB3040 30x40 Color: Twill $8.16 Each
FSE3636L Sheet, Fitted, Poly/Cotton Blend, 130 Thread
Count 36x80x6 Color: White Price per CA/12 $36.60 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
SHE6115L Sheet, Flat-T-130, Poly/Cotton Blend 66x115
Color: White Price per CA/12 $47.04 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
SHE6104P Sheet, Flat-T-180, Poly/Cotton Blend 66x104
Color: White Price per CA/12 $58.92 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
SHE6115P Sheet, Flat-T-180, Poly/Cotton Blend 66x115
Color: White Price per CA/12 $69.96 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
41400 Towel, Regular Grade, 100% Terry Cotton 20 x
40 White - Price per DZ $17.16 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
41050 Washcloth, 100% Terry Cotton, Regular Grade

12x12 Color: White Price per DZ

$3.00 per Dozen

Sold by the Dozen

CATEGORY: UNIFORMS/CLOTHING

BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Price Each
ELBLCTN Women's Briefs, 100% Cotton, size11-14, White
$9.90 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
ELBLCTN Women's Briefs, 100% Cotton, size15-16, White
° $10.20 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
ELBLCTN Wo.men 's Briefs, 100% Cotton, Sizes 5 - 10,
White $9.65 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
7601N Men's Briefs (Fruit of the Loom), 100% Cotton, S-| Sold only in a Pack of 3
XL, White $6.49 per Case of 3 per Size
7601N Men's Briefs (Fruit of the Loom), 100% Cotton, Sold only in a Pack of 3
XXL - XXXL, White $8.49 per Case of 3 per Size
EBASPLS Spo.rts Bra, Poly/Cotton/Lycra Blend, 32-38,
White $20.40 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
EBASPLS Spo.rts Bra, Poly/Cotton/Lycra Blend, 40 - 54,
White $22.44 per Dozen Sold by the Dozen
SPGY Grey Sweatpants, 55/45 Cotton/Poly, Elastic
cuff, no pocket, no strings, S-XL, Color: Grey $5.49
SPGY Grey Sweatpants, 55/45 Cotton/Poly, Elastic cuff, no
pocket, no strings XXL-XXXL, Color: Grey $6.00
L4595 Ladies sport sock, 80% Cotton 20% other, One-

size fits all, White

$4.32 per Dozen

Sold by the Dozen

ELBLCTN-5,6,7,8 or 9

Ladies panty, 100% Cotton, Sizes 5 - 9, White

$9.65 per Dozen

Sold by the Dozen

WDA4236

Apron, Poly/Cotton Blend, White, Size 33 -
Priced per Dozen

No Bid

MBB-KH, MBB-NV

Belt, Cotton webbed belt w/brass Buckle -
Color: Khaki, Navy - Priced by CA/12

$16.78 per Dozen

Sold by the Dozen

TGS, TKS, TPBS,TYS, TBRS, TLGS,
TGYS, TOS, TWNS

Detention Shirt, TriStitch, 65% Poly/35% Cotton,
no pocket, Stencil on front top left chest
0.C.C.V. (horizontal 1.5") and 0.C.C.V. on back,
middle of shirt (horizontal 2.25") Stencils in
white or black / Size: S-3XL / Color: Green,
Khaki, Postman Blue, Yellow, Chocolate Brown,
Lime Green, Medium Gray, Orange, Wine

$7.50 - for sizes S-XL;
$8.20 for Sizes 2XL-3XL

Item Nos. for Detention Shirt, No Pocket:
NPKS = Khaki

NPOS = Orange

JZ-NPS-GRAY = Gray

JZ-NPS-GRN = Green

JZ-NPS-LG = Lime Green

NPS-PB = Postman Blue

NPS-WN = Wine

NPS-YW = Yellow

TBRSNP = Chocolate Brown

Price includes
screening on
chest and
screening on
the back of
shirt; No
Pocket Shirts
in Colors
Gray, Green,
Lime Green,

TGT, TKT, TPBT, TYT, TBRT, TLGT,

Detention Trousers, TriStitch, 65% Poly/35%
Cotton, no pocket, mock fly, Stencil on outside
right trouser leg OCCV (vertical 4") Stencils in

TGYT, TOT, TWNT white or black / Size: S-3XL / Green, Khaki,
Postman Blue, Yellow, Chocolate Brown, Lime L. ; )
Green, Medium Gray, Orange, Wine Price inlcudes Screening on Right
$7.97 Leg of Trouser
M4595 Men's Ankle Socks, Cotton Blend - One Size

Price per Dozen

$4.80 per Dozen

Sold by the Dozen

709-M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL

Pajama bottom, 50/50 blend, pull on, no
drawstring, no pocket, M-2XL Color:Navy

$4.92

VRP

Poncho, 10-gauge, One Size w/hood, Vinyl Rain,
Color: Clear Price per Dozen

$36.24 per Dozen

Sold by the Dozen ‘




SEVA-BK-S, M, L, XL, 2XL

Sandal, EVA, Open Toe, Lt weight, slip odor &
stress resistant, Size: Small-2XL Color: Black

Price per Pair $3.58

2901-7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13 Shoe Hi Top, Hvy Dufy Canvas,. Velcro Tab, Size 7:
13 Color: Black - Price per Pair $9.40

Shoe Women, Canvas, Lace up, Size 5-9 Color:
903-5,6,7,8,9

T White $7.55

SPGY-4XL, 5XL, 6XL Sweat-pants, Grey, 55/45, Elastic cuff, no pocket,
no strings, 4XL-6XL Color: Gray $6.00

Sweatshirt, Gildan crewneck, 7.80z 50/50
cotton/polyester, Size S-3XL Color(s):Dark
Gray, Medium Gray

$9.30 for sizes S-XL
$11.30 for sizes 2XL-3XL

Colors: Ash Gray, Dark Heather Gray, Charcoal
Gray

Sweatshirt, Hanes crewneck, 7.80z 50/50
cotton/polyester, Size S-3XL
Color(s):Dark Gray, Medium Gray

SIU0.US TOF SIZes S-XL
$12.50 for Size 2XL
$14.50 for Size 3XL

Sweatshirt, Jerzees, crewneck, 7.80z 50/50
cotton/polyester, Size S-3XL
Color(s):Dark Gray, Medium Gray

$7.79 for sizes S-XL
59.90 for sizes 2XL-3XL

Color Available: Ash Gray

Colors: Athletic Heather Gray

683-S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL

T-Shirt, 100% Cotton, 3.830z, preshrunk, xlong
tail, Size S-3XL  Color: White Price
per DZ

$29.56 for sizes S-XL
$30.00 for sizes 2XL-3XL

Sold by the Dozen

ZBTSASH-S

T-Shirt, 50/50, Heavy Wt, Preshrunk, 5.60z Size:
Small Color: Ash

$3.62 for Sizes S-XL
$6.48 for Sizes 2XL-3XL

ZBTSGOLD-3XL

T-Shirt, 50/50, Heavy Wt, Preshrunk, 5.60z Size:
3XL Color: Gold

$3.62 for Sizes S-XL
$6.48 for Sizes 2XL-3XL

T-Shirt, 50/50, Heavy Wt, Preshrunk, 5.60z Size:
3XL, 4X, 5X, 6X Color: Most Cost Effective -Bid
to include minimum 3 color choices. Example of
colors but not limited to Navy Blue, Green,

$3.62 for Sizes S-XL

bl

Not avail in Size 6XL.

$6.48 for Sizes 2XL-3XL

Colors Available: Navy, Forest Green, Kelly Green, Yellow,

ZBTS ' Azalea (Pink), Orange, Black, Ash Gray, Purple, Dark
Yellow, Pink, Orange, Black, Gray, Brown, Heather Gray, Gold, Carolina Blue, Brown, Light Blue,
California Blue. NO RED OR WHITE
Maroon, Purple, Roayl Blue, Safety Green
$6.48 for Sizes 4XL-5XL
T-Shirt, Economy, 100% Preshrunk Cotton,
671 3.30z, size S-3XL Color: White Price $23.11 for sizes S-XL
per CA/12 $25.30 for sizes 2XL-3XL Sold by the Dozen
SPNV Navy Sweatpants Elastic, no pocket, no strings,
S-6XL
$6.50
CROSSBACK Lifeline Crossback Smock
$157.59
Ultra Blend Jersey Polo, S-5XL, Gray, Black, B
28800 . 5 Hable:
Green, Maroon, Navy, Red, Blue $7.05 fOl‘. sizes S-XL Colors Available: Ash Gray, Black, Maroon,
$8.40 for sizes 2XL-5XL Forest Green, Royal Blue, Red, Navy
12-G180 zy(lleatshin, Crewneck, 50/50 Gildan, Navy, S- $9.30 for sizes S-XL
$11.30 for sizes 2XL-5XL Not available in Size 6XL
BXP Boxers, Assorted Solid Colors and Print, S-2XL $18.72 for sizes Medium- |Not available in size Small. Sold
2XL by the Dozen
CATEGORY: RECREATION
BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION .
Price Each
Universal, Inflating needle for athletic balls
NEEDLE6
6/PK $3.24
CATEGORY: SECURITY/PREVENTION
BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION .
Price Each
Suicide Prevention/Isolation Gowns-Adult,
505 Adult sizes, Chest Sizes 44" to 56", Sherwood
Green 575_24
BOB BARKER CATALOG Isolation/Suicide Cell Blanket, 80X54, Sherwood
Green $72.49
Tumbler, Milk, Virtually Unbreakable, Scratch
950C Resistant 9.5 oz. Color: Clear Price per
CA/48 $45.12
ESU2S Utensil, Eco Security, Paperboard Price per
CA/2500
$170.00
CATEGORY: PERSONAL CARE/HYGEINE
BOB BARKER ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION .
Price Each
210 Bag, Disp Fem Hyg Prod, 4"x2"x9" - Priced
CA/1000 $40.87
CLUB Brush, Club/military, No Handle, Nylon Bristle,
4" Price by CS/24 $17.52
s Comb, 5" Polypropylene, Pocket Color: Black
Price by CA/144 $3.66
COMB-8H Comb, Shampoo, Large, Color: Black 8.25" Price
by Dozen $3.00
023 Conditioner, Hair Dress Blue Magic, Alcohol Free
40z. - Price by Dozen $22.78
FD-05 Deodorant Stick, Max Security, Unscented,
Alcohol Free .5 oz. - Price by CA/144 74.88 per Case of 144
MS6787 Deodorant Stick, Max Sec.urlty, Unscented,
Alcohol Free 2.250z - Price by CA/24 $30.48
Deodorant, Sure Regular 1.7 oz. Price
PR32627
by CA/12 $20.88
L506 Hair Lotion, Luster's Pink Original Price
by CA/12 $62.52
40653W-40 Lace-Flat-Woven Polyester 40" - Price per .
CA/144 No Bid
74000 Lo.tlon, Suave Cocoa Butter 100z -
Price per CA $18.33 per Case of 6
2264 Lotion, Suave Skin Therapy 100z - Price
per CA $18.89 per Case of 6
Maxi thin Long Super Wings Price
SN288-C
per CA/288 $23.04
P Petroleum Jelly, Fresh scent 40z Price
per CA/12 $12.60




PICK-5 Pick, 5" Afro Black Price per Dozen $1.80
Sanitary Napkin, Ultrathin Wings Price
44340 per CA/216 $16.62
NXB16 Only sold by the Dozen. GoodSense 8 oz,
Sunblock Lotion, SPF 30 - Price per CA/6 $62.04 per Dozen SPF 30 Sport Suncreen Lotion
BBSO Toothbrush, 50 Tuft Soft, Nylon Bristle,
Individually wrapped - Price per Case $10.60 per Case of 144
THa2 Toothbrush, Thumb Handle, Nylon Bristle,
Individually Wrapped, 3" - Price per CA/72 $3.70
74000 Lotion, Suave Cocoa Butter 100z Price
per CA/6 $18.33 per Case of 6
2264 Lotion, Suave Skin Therapy 100z Price
per CA/6 $18.89 per Case of 6
FM85 Toothpaste, mint, .85 oz Price per CA/144 $25.68

Pricing Guarantee:

One (1) year from date of award

Payment Terms / Discount:

NET30

Warranty Info:

30 day satisfaction guarantee

Delivery: Standard order

7-10 days for stock items. For Non-Stock, Made-to-Order items, please allow
an estimated 12 week delivery ARO.

Delivery: Stenciled items
(Children's Village) from date of
order (Required):

Stenciling on stock pants have a lead-time of 10-14 days from ARO. Non-Stock,
No Pocket Shirts with Stenciling will have an estimated delivery of 14 weeks
ARO.

Minimum Order?

Non-Stock and Made-to-Order Shirts, Pants, and Jumpsuits are only sold in a
Case of 6 per color/size. Details regarding our Selling Unit of Measure / Case
Packaging are noted beside each specified item above (where applicable and
was not already part of the Item Description)

Exceptions Taken? Yes/No

Yes. Please see Notes and Exceptions Column. Applicable details are entered
above for UOM, colors, case packaging, and size availablility

Comments / Exceptions:

See notes and exceptions column entered above, listed beside each item for
detailed exceptions.
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Q()AKLAND?

COUNTY MICHIGAN OAKLAND COUNTY EXECUTIVE DAVID COULTER
PURCHASING

Scott Guzzy, Purchasing Administrator
(248) 858-5484 | guzzys@oakgov.com

BLANKET CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Inasmuch as no specific quantities are indicated on this contract, there is no commitment involved by Oakland County other than for the
payment of goods procured under the conditions of this contract.

Oakland County issues individual Purchase Orders on behalf of County Departments as authorization for items ordered from this contract.
The individual Purchase Order numbers are to be used on all Invoices, Bills of Lading, Shipping Documents, and all correspondence relating
to the Purchase Order.

Vendor shall submit an itemized invoice with amounts due and owing under Purchase Order, as of the date of the invoice. Invoices shall
contain the following information:

(a) County Purchase Order Number; (b) dates of Deliverables; (c) itemized list of Deliverables; (d) Vendor Tax ID Number (federal and
State); (e) licenses; and (f) any other information requested by Purchasing. The County shall have no obligation to make a payment under
purchase order until an invoice is submitted in the form set forth herein and shall have no obligation to pay for Deliverables, which have not
been invoiced (as required herein) within sixty (60) Days of delivery.

This contract is not to be used for the purchase of any equipment and or services not listed herein. Oakland County requires a 30-day
written notice of all price changes. Oakland County reserves the right to take advantage of any special pricing programs available from the
contract vendor or any other outside vendors offering the said special pricing programs to Oakland County during the term of this contract.

Oakland County reserves the right to cancel this contract if orders are not filled within the time and in accordance with the terms specified.

All shipments must be accompanied by Packing Slips and containers properly marked with requesting Department Name, Address, Contact
Person and Purchase Order Number.

The prices indicated on this contract are not subject to change without written notification within 30 Days in advance.

No Charges will be allowed for boxing or packing unless stated on the Contract. Acceptance of this contract includes specifications,
process, delivery, and conditions included therein. Material is subject to inspection on our property. If rejected, we agree to first advise
vendor before returning goods. All freight and extra handling charges derived from said rejection shall be borne by the vendor. The
acceptance of this contract does not in any way make the County of Oakland a party to any infringement or damage suits. Such suits to be
borne by the vendor.

Compliance with Laws. Contractor shall comply with all federal, state, and local laws, statutes, ordinances, regulations, insurance
policy requirements, and requirements applicable to its activities under this Contract, including zoning and building codes and MIOSHA
guidelines

Contractor, and its subcontractors under this Contract, shall not discriminate against an employee or an applicant for employment in hiring,
any terms and conditions of employment or matters related to employment regardless of race, color, religion, sex, sexual orientation,
gender identity or expression, national origin, age, genetic information, height, weight, disability, veteran status, familial status, marital
status or any other reason, that is unrelated to the person's ability to perform the duties of a particular job or position, in accordance with
applicable federal and state laws.

Contractor shall promptly notify the County of any complaint or charge filed and/or determination by any Court or administrative agency of
illegal discrimination by Contractor.

The County, in its discretion, may consider any illegal discrimination described above as a breach of this Contract and may terminate or
cancel this Contract immediately with notice.

A Materials Safety Data Sheet shall accompany or precede all shipments of materials subject to the Michigan Hazard Communications
Standard also known as the “Right to Know Law” and classified as hazardous by Michigan Compiled Laws, Act 154 of the Public Acts of
1974 as amended. All containers shall have approved warning labels in accordance with this law. Copies of all MSDS’s are to be sent to
the requesting department.

Pursuant to Act 167 of the Public Acts of 1933, the County of Oakland, a Michigan Constitutional Corporation, is exempt from the sales tax
provisions of this Act. In addition, the Michigan Department of Treasury has promulgated General and Specific Sales and Use Tax Rules
which provide that the County of Oakland is not required to have a sales tax exemption number (R205.79; Rule 29).

FOR REPORTING PURPOSES — COUNTY OF OAKLAND I.D. #38-6004876W.

2100 Pontiac Lake Road | County Executive Building 41W | Waterford, MI 48328 | Fax (248) 858-1677 | OakGov.com/purchasing



